Re: Worker's Comp and Track4LA

Subject: Re: Worker's Comp and Track4LA

From: Lorena Parker <Iparker@sanpedrobid.com>

Date: 11/15/2017 10:42 AM

To: Thomas Nelson <thomas.nelson@Ilacity.org>

CC: Rick Scott <rick.scott@lacity.org>, Adriana Velazquez <adriana.velazquez@lacity.org>, Maximo
Fortu <maximo.fortu@lacity.org>, macky@lacity.org

Thank you for the update.

Lorena Parker

Executive Director

San Pedro Property Owners' Alliance
San Pedro Historic Waterfront
Business Improvement District

390 W. 7th Street | San Pedro, CA 90731
T310.832.2183 | F 310.832.0685
Lparker@sanpedrobid.com
www.sanpedrobid.com

On Tue, Nov 14, 2017 at 3:33 PM, Thomas Nelson <thomas.nelson@I|acity.org> wrote:
Hi Lorena,

Here is the status for invoice 2017-24 (the latest invoice we have for San Pedro Historic Waterfront.
The payment was approved by our controllers office and is schedule to be go out on 11/28/2017.

Thank you
Thomas

On Tue, Nov 14, 2017 at 3:25 PM, Rick Scott <rick.scott@lacity.org> wrote:
Please advise Lorena about the San Pedro invoice. Thank you.

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Lorena Parker <|parker@sanpedrobid.com>
Date: Tue, Nov 14, 2017 at 11:32 AM

Subject: Re: Worker's Comp and Track4LA

To: Rick Scott <rick.scott@lacity.org>

Rick,
Great. Can you also confirm when my outstanding invoice will be processed?

Thank you.

Lorena Parker

Executive Director

San Pedro Property Owners' Alliance
San Pedro Historic Waterfront
Business Improvement District

390 W. 7th Street | San Pedro, CA 90731
T310.832.2183 | F 310.832.0685
Lparker@sanpedrobid.com
www.sanpedrobid.com

On Mon, Nov 13, 2017 at 6:27 PM, Rick Scott <rick.scott@lacity.org> wrote:
Yes. Expiration date: 11/14/2018.

ACCEPTED INSURANCE information for CA Number: 629013

CA No. 629013 |Contract No |
Insured Name SAN PEDRO PROPERTY OWNERS ALLIANCE
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Re: Worker's Comp and Track4LA

Acceptance Date 11/13/2017 Cancel Date

Temp Date Reinstate Date

Cancel/Reinstate

Status

Notes:

Other Name Type Other Name

No other name found

Coverage Type Work Comp Limits $1,000,000
Continuous No Carrier HARTFORD UNDERWRITERS INS CO
Policy No 76 WEG EV1865 |Effective Date 11/14/2017

Waiver of subrogation Expiration Date  |11/14/2018

Documents submitted to the City of LA are public records and will be available for public inspection and copying as required by law.
For questions regarding insurance/bonds please e-mail us at cao.insurance.bonds@lacity.org or call us at 213-978-7475.
For contract related questions please contact the contracting Department. To view the City of LA Department list, click here
Property of The City of Los Angeles, Disclaimer

PAYCHEX INSURANCE AGENCY INC - MANUALLY PROCESSED

Those usual to the Insured's Operations. Waiver of Subrogation applies in avor of the Certificate
Holder per Waiver of our Right to Recover from Others
Endorsement WC 04 03 06 attached to this policy.

On Mon, Nov 13, 2017 at 5:36 PM, Lorena Parker <|parker@sanpedrobid.com> wrote:
Rick,

Can you please check the website to make sure you've received the most recent Worker's comp
insurance cert?

Thank you.

Lorena Parker

Executive Director

San Pedro Property Owners' Alliance
San Pedro Historic Waterfront
Business Improvement District

390 W. 7th Street | San Pedro, CA 90731
T310.832.2183 | F 310.832.0685
Lparker@sanpedrobid.com
www.sanpedrobid.com

Rick Scott

Neighborhood and Business Improvement District Division
Office of the City Clerk

213.978.1121 direct

213.978.1099 main

Fax 213.978.1130

Rick.Scott@lacity.org
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Rick Scott

Neighborhood and Business Improvement District Division
Office of the City Clerk

213.978.1121 direct

213.978.1099 main

Fax 213.978.1130

Rick.Scott@lacity.org

Tom Nelson

Accounting Clerk

City Clerk NBIDS section
Los Angeles
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